St. Lucie

PUBLIC SCHOOLS Q

St. Lucie Public Schools

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

329 N.W. COMMERCE PARK DRIVE

PORT ST. LUCIE, FL 34986
PH: 772-336-6980
FAX: 772-336-6985

Tabulation/Notice of Intent

Solicitation Number and Title:

ITB 12-17- Handrails — Repair, Remove and
Installation

Vendor:
CAM Group, LLC

Vendor
Custom Welding Diversified, Inc.

Vendor
Fat Boyz Welding & Repair

Contact Name and Address
Ana McGregor

15375 Skyking Drive

Port St. Lucie, FL 34987

Contact Name and Address
Tommy Creel

1983 SW Biltmore Street
Port St. Lucie, FL 34984

Contact Name and Address
Richard Brendlinger

1662 SE Memorial Street
Port St. Lucie, FL 34983

Date Opened: April 12, 2012 @ 3:00 p.m. Phone Fax Phone Fax Phone Fax
1-866-652-9050 772-293- 772-879-6928 772-879-6390 772-519-2602 772-873-6172
No. of Vendors Notified: 12 9266
No. of Vendors Responded: 8
Unit Option Option Unit Option Option Unit Option Option
ITEM Price Year Year Price Year Year Price Year Year
1 2 1 2 1 2
Pricing Schedule New
Installations Only
1 | Per lineal foot for polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 41.04 45.14
handrails
2 | Per lineal foot for bended 50.00 55.00 60.50 75.00 82.50 90.75 34.00 36.72 40.39
handrails
3 | Per lineal foot for aluminum 50.00 55.00 60.50 75.00 82.50 90.75 34.00 36.72 40.39
handrails
4 | Per lineal foot for (other) 25.00 27.50 30.25 45.00 49.50 54.45 35.00 37.80 41.58
1-1/2 1-1/2 1-1/2 Aluminum | Aluminum Aluminum Any other Any other Any other
Schedule Schedule Schedule Grab ralil Grab rail Grab ralil handrail handralil handrail
80 Single 80 Single 80 Single material not | material not | material not
Pipe Pipe Pipe listed listed above | listed above
above.
Repair work shall be based on
hourly rates plus materials
cost
1 | Hourly rate for Journeyman 55.00 60.50 66.55 85.00 93.50 102.85 50.00 54.00 59.40




Tabulation/Notice of Intent

Solicitation Number and Title:

ITB 12-17 - Handrails — Repair,
Remove and Installation

Date Opened: April 12, 2012 @

Vendor:
CAM Group, LLC

Vendor
Custom Welding Diversified, Inc.

Vendor
Fat Boyz Welding & Repair

Contact Name and Address
Ana McGregor

15375 Skyking Drive

Port St. Lucie, FL 34987

Contact Name and Address
Tommy Creel

1983 SW Biltmore Street
Port St. Lucie, FL 34984

Contact Name and Address
Richard Brendlinger

1662 SE Memorial Street
Port St. Lucie, FL 34983

3:00 p.m. Phone Fax Phone Fax Phone Fax
. 1-866-652-9050 772-293-9266 772-879-6928 772-879-6390 772-519-2602 772-873-6172
No. of Vendors Notified: 12
No. of Vendors Responded: 8
Unit Option Option Unit Option Option Unit Option Option
ITEM Price Year Year Price Year Year Price Year Year
1 2 1 2 1 2
2 | Hourly rate for 33.00 36.30 39.93 45.00 49.50 54.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
apprentice
3 | Hourly rate for Helper 27.00 29.70 32.67 45.00 49,50 54.45 15.00 16.20 17.82
Equipment Rental — 10% 10% 10% 15% 15% 15% 8% 8% 8%
Contractor’s actual
cost plus percentage
bid
Materials — 10% 10% 10% 15% 15% 15% 8% 8% 8%
Contractor’s actual
cost plus percentage
bid




St. Lucie

B —
PUBLIC SCHOOLS

St. Lucie Public Schools

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
329 N.W. COMMERCE PARK DRIVE

PORT ST. LUCIE, FL 34986

PH: 772-336-6980
FAX: 772-336-6985

Tabulation/Notice of Intent

Solicitation Number and Title:

ITB 12-17 - Handrails — Repair, Remove and
Installation

Vendor:
Grove Welders, Inc.

Vendor
Hennis Construction Co., Inc.

Vendor

Macy Construction Corp.

Contact Name and Address
David J. Whitehouse
1035 9" Street, SW

Vero Beach, FL 32962

Contact Name and Address
Gerard Hennis

18500 Glades Cutoff Road
Port St. Lucie, FL 34987

Contact Name and Address

Reid Macy

715 Tumblin Kling

Fort Pierce, FL 34982

Date Opened: April 12,2012 @ 3:00 p.m. Phone Fax Phone Fax Phone Fax
P 772-569-1222 772-569-6362 | 772-464-2404 772-464- 772-201-0339 772-467-6711
No. of Vendors Responded: 8 4114
Unit Option Option Unit Option Option Unit Option Option
ITEM Price Year Year Price Year Year Price Year Year
1 2 1 2 1 2
Pricing Schedule New
Installations Only
1 | Per lineal foot for polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid 65.00 68.25 71.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid
handrails
2 | Per lineal foot for bended 140.00 144.20 148.53 65.00 68.25 71.66 49.00 49.00 49.00
handrails
3 | Per lineal foot for aluminum 150.00 154.50 159.13 65.00 68.25 71.66 47.00 47.00 47.00
handrails
4 | Per lineal foot for (other) No Bid No Bid No Bid 75.00 78.75 82.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule Schedule Schedule
40 Steel 40 Steel 40 Steel
Repair work shall be based on
hourly rates plus materials
cost
1 | Hourly rate for Journeyman 80.00 82.40 84.87 100.00 105.00 110.25 37.50 37.50 37.50




Tabulation/Notice of Intent

Solicitation Number and Title:

ITB 12-17 - Handrails — Repair, Remove and
Installation

Vendor:
Grove Welders, Inc.

Vendor
Hennis Construction Co., Inc.

Vendor
Macy Construction Corp.

Contact Name and Address
1035 9™ Street, SW
Vero Beach, FL 32962

Contact Name and Address
Gerard Hennis

18500 Glades Cutoff Road
Port St. Lucie, FL 34987

Contact Name and Address
Reid Macy

715 Tumblin Kling

Fort Pierce, FL 34982

. . . Phone Fax Phone Fax Phone Fax
Date Opened: April 12, 2012 @ 3:00 p.m. 772-569-1222 772-569-6362 | 772-464-2404 772-464-4114 | 772-201-0339 772-467-6711
No. of Vendors Notified: 12
No. of Vendors Responded: 8
Unit Option Option Unit Option Option Unit Option Option
ITEM Price Year Year Price Year Year Price Year Year
1 2 1 2 1 2

2 | Hourly rate for Apprentice No Bid No Bid No Bid 95.00 99.75 104.74 30.00 30.00 30.00
3 | Hourly rate for Helper 70.00 72.10 74.26 75.00 78.75 82.69 27.00 27.00 27.00
4 | Equipment Rental — contractor’s 15% 15% 15% 10% 10% 10% 15% 15% 15%

actual cost plus percentage bid
5 | Materials — contractor’s Actual 15% 15% 15% 10% 10% 10% 15% 15% 15%

Cost Plus percentage bid




St. Lucie

PUBLIC SCHOOLS w

St. Lucie Public Schools

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
329 N.W. COMMERCE PARK DRIVE
PORT ST. LUCIE, FL 34986
PH: 772-336-6980
FAX: 772-336-6985

Tabulation/Notice of Intent

Solicitation Number and Title:

ITB 12-17 - Handrails — Repair, Remove and
Installation

Date Opened: April 12,2012 @ 3:00 p.m.

Vendor

Gilmore Portable Welding Services, Inc.

Contact Name and Address

Dale Gilmore

10761 Schwab Road
Fort Pierce, Fl 34945

Phone Fax
No. of Vendors Notified: 12 772-201-7950 None
No. of Vendors Responded: 8
Unit Option Option
ITEM Price Year Year
1 2
Pricing Schedule New No Bid No Bid No Bid
Installations Only
1 | Per lineal foot for polymer No Bid No Bid No Bid
handrails
2 | Per lineal foot for bended No Bid No Bid No Bid
handrails
3 | Per lineal foot for aluminum No Bid No Bid No Bid
handrails
4 | Per lineal foot for (other) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Repair work shall be based on
hourly rates plus materials
cost
1 | Hourly rate for Journeyman No Bid No Bid No Bid




_ _ Vendor
Tabulation / Notice of Intent Gilmore Portable Welding Services, Inc.

Solicitation Number and Title:

Contact Name and Address

ITB 12-17 - Handrails — Repair, Remove and Dale Gilmore
Installation 10761 Schwab Road

Fort Pierce, Fl 34945

Date Opened: April 12, 2012 @ 3:00 p.m. Phone Fax
. 772-201-7950 None
No. of Vendors Notified: 12
No. of Vendors Responded: 8
Option Option
ITEM Unit Year Year
Price 1 2

2 | Hourly rate for Apprentice No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 | Hourly rate for Helper No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 | Equipment Rental — contractor’s No Bid No Bid No Bid

actual cost plus percentage bid
5 | Materials — contractor’s actual No Bid No Bid No Bid

cost plus percentage bid

Other Information: This is a notice of the District’s intent to award
Vendors Recommended for Award are as follows:

Installation Projects: Fat Boyz Welding & Repair

Repair Work: Fat Boyz Welding and Macy Construction Corporation

For repair work, both contractors shall meet at the same time and date for a walk-through. One walk-through shall be scheduled for each repair job. The Contractor
providing the lowest quote meeting all specifications and using the rates bid will be awarded the project.

*Non responsive vendor : Dwyer Industries, Inc. submitted bid documents from a previous bid.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in s. 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceeding under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes

Posted April 30, 2012 @ 1:00 p.m.
Revision Posted May 14, 2012 @ 10:00 a.m.




