Position

Achieving
Milestones, Inc.

Speech-Language Patholog $ 57.00
N

Audiologist
Renewal 1 Speech
Renewal 2 Speech
Renewal 3 Speech
Renewal 1 Audio
Renewal 2 Audio
Renewal 3 Audio
Renewal Increase 1
Renewal Increase 2
Renewal Increase 3

0 BID
$ 57.00
$ 57.00
$ 57.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
0.00%
0.00%
0.00%

Staffing
Options &
Solutions, Inc.

$ 59.00
NO BID
H 59.00
$ 59.00
$ 59.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
0.00%
0.00%
0.00%

Cell Staff, LLC

$ 59.00
No Bid
H 60.18
$ 60.18
$ 60.18
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
2.00%
0.00%
0.00%

Advanced
Medical
Personnel

Services D/B/A

$

Advanced
Schools
65.00

NO BID

H
S
$

66.04
67.10
68.17

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
1.60%
1.60%
1.60%

RV SRV SRV SRV RV RV SRV SRV

EBS

59.85

3Chords, Inc.
DBA Therapy

$

Travelers

60.00

59.85 NOBID

59.85
59.85
61.65
59.85
59.85
61.65
0.00%
0.00%
3.00%

H
S
$

60.00
61.20
62.42

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
0.00%
2.00%
2.00%

BT SRV SRV SRV SRV RV S

Community
Rehab
Associates

62.45
65.00
62.45
62.45
62.45
65.00
65.00
65.00
0.00%
0.00%
0.00%

A;hs"e“h Jackson THE

» 3PV Therapy EXECU/SEARC

rofession - tners H GROUP, INC.

als, Inc.

$ 5900 $ 5800 $ 58.50

NOBID  NOBID  NOBID

$ 6077 $ 5800 $ 58.50

$ 6320 $ 5916 $ 58.50

$ 6636 $ 6034 S 58.50

NOBID  NOBID NO BID

NOBID ~ NOBID NOBID

NOBID  NOBID NO BID
3.00%  0.00% 0.00%
4.00% 2.00% 0.00%
5.00% 2.00% 0.00%

NEW

MEDISCAN II,

$

LLC DBA
Mediscan
Staffing
Services
59.85

NO BID

$
S
$

61.65
63.49
65.40
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
3.00%
3.00%
3.00%

PROGRESS

THERAPY,
LLC

$  60.95
NO BID
S 60.95
S 6247
S 6247
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
0.00%
2.50%
0.00%

SUNBELT
STAFFING,

RY SRV SRV SRV RV RV SR7 SRV

LLC

62.00
62.00
62.93
63.87
64.83
62.93
63.87
64.83
1.50%
1.50%
1.50%

ALL SOURCE
RECRUITING
GROUP, INC.
d/b/a Ardor
Health
Solutions
$ 59.00
NO BID
H 59.00
$ 59.59
$ 59.59
NO BID
NOBID
NO BID
0.00%
1.00%
0.00%

coss
PEDIATRIC
SPEECH
SERVICES,
INC.

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

61.00

61.00
62.22
63.46

0.00%
2.00%
2.00%

TRAINOR
PEDIATRIC

HERITAGE

HEALTHCARE,
INC. D/b/a SPEECH AND

lingua health LANGUAGE
8 THERAPY, INC.

$ 68.00 $ 60.00
NO BID NO BID
H 68.68 S 60.00
$ 7005 $ 60.00
$ 7145 $ 60.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
1.00% 0.00%
2.00% 0.00%
2.00% 0.00%

KIRSTEN T.
CHISM

58.00

59.10
60.22
61.37

1.90%
1.90%
1.90%

SPEECH
EHAB
SERVICES, LLC

$ 59.75
NO BID
H 59.75
$ 59.75
$ 59.75
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
0.00%
0.00%
0.00%

COMPREHENSI
VE THERAPY
CONSULTANTS
,INC.

61.00

61.00
61.00
62.22

0.00%
0.00%
2.00%

GENERAL

HEALTHCARE
RESOURCES,

RY SRV SRV SRV SRV RV NR7 SRV

INC.

66.00
68.00
67.98
7138
76.38
70.04
73.54
78.69
3.00%
5.00%
7.00%

JENNIFER
MCDANIEL,
INC

55.00

55.00
56.38
59.19

2.50%
5.00%

ADVANCE
SPEECH
THERAPY
SERVICES,
INC.

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

60.00

60.00
60.00
60.00

0.00%
0.00%
0.00%

ASKEW
SPEECH &
LANGUAGE
THERAPY, INC.

56.00

56.00
56.00
56.00

0.00%
0.00%
0.00%

SMITH &
FLEMING,
LLC

$  60.00
NO BID
$  60.00
S 60.00
$  60.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
0.00%
0.00%
0.00%

AUDREY B.
GREENWALD, M.S.,
CCC, P.A. DBA Boca

Speech
$ 61.00
NO BID
H 61.00
$ 61.00
$ 61.00
NO BID
NOBID
NO BID
0.00%
0.00%
0.00%

MYTHERAPYC
OMPANY LLC

$ 60.00
NO BID
H 60.75
$ 6151
$ 62.28
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
1.25%
1.25%
1.25%



